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SUMMARY: This document contains final 
regulations relating to the deduction under 
section 221 of the Internal Revenue Code 
(Code) for interest paid on qualified edu­
cation loans. The final regulations reflect 
the enactment and amendment of section 
221 by the Taxpayer Relief Act of 1997, 
the Internal Revenue Service Restructur­
ing and Reform Act of 1998, the Omnibus 
Consolidated and Emergency Supplemen­
tal Appropriations Act of 1999, and the 
Economic Growth and Tax Relief Recon­
ciliation Act of 2001. This document also 
contains amendments to the final regula­
tions under section 6050S relating to the 
information reporting requirements for in­
terest payments received on qualified ed­
ucation loans. The final regulations af­
fect taxpayers who pay interest on qual­
ified education loans and payees who re­
ceive payments of interest on qualified ed­
ucation loans. 

DATES: Effective Date: These final regu­
lations are effective May 7, 2004. 

Applicability Date:  Section 1.221–1 is  
applicable to periods governed by section 

221 as amended in 2001, which relates to 
interest paid on qualified education loans 
after December 31, 2001, and on or be­
fore December 31, 2010. Section 1.221–2 
is applicable to interest due and paid on 
qualified education loans after January 21, 
1999, but before January 1, 2002, and 
again after December 31, 2010. Taxpay­
ers also may apply §1.221–2 to interest due 
and paid on qualified education loans af­
ter December 31, 1997, but before January 
21, 1999. The amendments to §1.6050S–3 
provide a transitional rule for certain in­
terest payments with respect to qualified 
education loans made before September 1, 
2004, and provide guidance applicable to 
qualified education loans made on or after 
that date. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION 
CONTACT: Sean M. Dwyer at (202) 
622–5020 (not a toll-free number). 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background 

On January 21, 1999, the IRS pub­
lished a notice of proposed rulemaking 
(REG–116826–97, 1999–1 C.B. 701) in 
the Federal Register (64 FR 3257) under 
section 221 of the Code. The notice of 
proposed rulemaking implemented sec­
tion 202 of the Taxpayer Relief Act of 
1997, Public Law 105–34 (111 Stat. 778), 
which added section 221 to the Code. The 
IRS received written, including electronic, 
comments responding to the proposed 
regulations. There were no requests for a 
public hearing and none was held. 

Subsequent to the publication of the 
proposed regulations, section 412 of the 
Economic Growth and Tax Relief Recon­
ciliation Act of 2001, Public Law 107–16 
(115 Stat. 38) (2001 Act) amended sec­
tion 221 by eliminating the 60-month 
limitation period and the restriction on de­
ductions of interest a taxpayer pays during 
a period when the lender does not require 
payments. The 2001 Act also increased the 
income limitations relating to interest de­
ductions under section 221 from $55,000 
($75,000 for married individuals filing 
jointly) to $65,000 ($130,000 for married 
individuals filing jointly) and the income 

phase-out range from $40,000-$55,000 
($60,000-$75,000 for married individ­
uals filing jointly) to $50,000-$65,000 
($100,000-$130,000 for married individu­
als filing jointly). 

The 2001 Act amendments apply to in­
terest paid on qualified education loans af­
ter December 31, 2001. Accordingly, the 
final regulations appear in two sections to 
reflect the law before and after the effec­
tive date of the 2001 Act. Section 1.221–1 
is applicable to periods governed by sec­
tion 221 as amended in 2001, which re­
lates to interest paid on qualified educa­
tion loans after December 31, 2001, and 
on or before December 31, 2010. Section 
1.221–2 is applicable to interest due and 
paid on qualified education loans after Jan­
uary 21, 1999, but before January 1, 2002. 
Taxpayers also may apply §1.221–2 to in­
terest due and paid on qualified education 
loans after December 31, 1997, but before 
January 21, 1999. Unless the 2001 Act 
amendments are extended by future legis­
lation, section 1.221–2 also will apply to 
interest due and paid on qualified educa­
tion loans after December 31, 2010. 

After consideration of all the com­
ments, the proposed regulations under 
section 221 are adopted as amended by 
this Treasury decision. 

On April 29, 2002, the IRS published 
final regulations (T.D. 8992, 2002–1 C.B. 
981) in the Federal Register (67 FR 
20901) under section 6050S relating to in­
formation reporting for interest payments 
received on qualified education loans. The 
Taxpayer Relief Act of 1997 added section 
6050S to the Code, as well as section 221. 

Explanation and Summary of 
Comments 

Many of the comments concerned is­
sues relating to the 60-month limitation 
period, which the 2001 Act eliminated. 
These comments are discussed in 7. and 8. 
below because the 60-month period con­
tinues to apply to interest on qualified ed­
ucation loans due and paid after December 
31, 1997, but before January 1, 2002, and 
again after December 31, 2010. 
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1. Treatment of Capitalized Interest and 
Certain Fees 

Several commentators discussed the 
treatment of capitalized interest, loan 
origination fees, late fees, and certain 
insurance fees. Courts have defined the 
term “interest,” for income tax purposes, 
as compensation paid for the use or for­
bearance of money. See, e.g., Deputy v. 
Du Pont, 308 U.S. 488 (1940). Consis­
tent with this definition, the final regu­
lations provide that capitalized interest 
is deductible as qualified education loan 
interest. Generally, fees, such as loan orig­
ination fees or late fees, are interest if the 
fees represent a charge for the use or for­
bearance of money. Therefore, if the fees 
represent compensation to the lender for 
the cost of specific services performed in 
connection with the borrower ’s account, 
the fees are not interest for Federal income 
tax purposes. See Rev. Rul. 69–188, 
1969–1 C.B. 54, amplified by Rev. Rul. 
69–582, 1969–2 C.B. 29; see also, e.g., 
Trivett v. Commissioner, T.C. Memo. 
1977–161, aff’d on other grounds, 611  
F.2d 655 (6th Cir. 1979) (Tax Court found 
that certain fees, including insurance fees, 
were similar to payments for services ren­
dered and not deductible as interest). 

Some commentators expressed confu­
sion about how to apply the rules in the 
proposed regulations for allocating pay­
ments to principal or interest. In response 
to these comments, the final regulations 
provide guidance on the treatment and al­
location of such amounts. Under the final 
regulations, a payment generally first ap­
plies to interest that has accrued and re­
mains unpaid as of the date the payment 
is due and then applies to the outstanding 
principal. An example is included. 

2. Interest Paid by Someone Other Than 
the Taxpayer 

Several commentators requested guid­
ance on the treatment of an interest pay­
ment made by someone other than the tax­
payer. To provide consistency with sec­
tion 221(a), the final regulations provide, 
“Under section 221, an individual taxpayer 
may deduct from gross income certain in­
terest paid by the taxpayer during the tax­
able year on a qualified education loan.” 
(Emphasis added.) The final regulations 
also clarify that certain third party pay­

ments of interest are treated as first paid 
to the taxpayer and then paid by the tax­
payer to the lender, in a manner similar to 
the treatment of third party payments of 
tuition under §1.25A–5(b)(1). The final 
regulations provide for this treatment if a 
third party makes a payment of interest on 
a qualified education loan on behalf of a 
taxpayer. 

Thus, for example, if a third party pays 
interest on behalf of the taxpayer, as a gift 
to the taxpayer, the taxpayer may deduct 
this interest for Federal income tax pur­
poses, assuming fulfillment of all other re­
quirements of section 221. Similarly, if an 
employer pays interest to a lender on be­
half of the taxpayer, and the taxpayer as 
required by section 61 includes the pay­
ment in income for Federal income tax pur­
poses, the taxpayer may deduct this inter­
est, assuming fulfillment of all other re­
quirements of section 221. 

A commentator also recommended the 
allowance of a deduction to an individual 
even if the individual qualifies as a depen­
dent of a taxpayer under section 151. This 
recommendation was not adopted because 
it is contrary to section 221(c). 

3. Definition of Eligible Educational 
Institution 

Several commentators suggested ex­
panding the definition of eligible educa­
tional institution in a manner that is not 
consistent with the statutory definition 
under sections 221(d)(2) (formerly sec­
tion 221(e)(2) (redesignated by the 2001 
Act)) and 25A(f)(2). Accordingly, these 
comments were not adopted. Another 
commentator requested guidance on the 
deductibility of interest paid on a qual­
ified education loan if the educational 
institution loses its status as an eligible 
educational institution after the end of the 
academic period for which the loan was 
incurred. The final regulations include 
a new example illustrating that the de­
ductibility of interest on the loan is not 
affected by the institution’s subsequent 
change in status. 

4. Definition of Qualified Education Loan 

The definition of qualified education 
loan in section 221(d)(1) (formerly sec­
tion 221(e)(1) (redesignated by the 2001 
Act)) provides, in part, that the indebt­
edness must be incurred by the taxpayer 

solely to pay higher education expenses 
that are paid within a reasonable period of 
time before or after the indebtedness is in­
curred. Several comments were received 
in connection with this “reasonable period 
of time” requirement. 

One commentator suggested extending 
the 60-day safe harbor provided in the pro­
posed regulations for satisfying the “rea­
sonable period of time” requirement to 90 
days or changing it so that the beginning 
of the safe harbor period is the earlier of 
60 days prior to the start of the academic 
period or the end of the previous academic 
period. Two commentators suggested ex­
tending the safe harbor to 90 days after 
the end of the academic period. Another 
commentator expressed concern that ex­
penses paid with loans disbursed outside 
the 60-day window would not satisfy the 
“reasonable period of time” requirement. 
Finally, one commentator interpreted the 
safe harbor to impose a 60-day limit on 
loans that are part of a federal postsec­
ondary loan program. 

The final regulations provide that what 
constitutes a reasonable period of time is 
determined based on all the relevant facts 
and circumstances. The final regulations 
also provide that qualified higher educa­
tion expenses are treated as paid or in­
curred within a reasonable period of time 
under the following circumstances: 1) the 
expenses are paid with the proceeds of 
education loans that are part of a federal 
postsecondary education loan program; or 
2) the expenses relate to a particular aca­
demic period and the loan proceeds used 
to pay the expenses are disbursed within a 
period that begins 90 days before the start 
of, and ends 90 days after the end of, the 
academic period to which the expenses re­
late. 

One commentator recommended ex­
pansion of the federal loan safe harbor 
described above to include expenses paid 
with the proceeds of any non-federal loan 
disbursed under policies mirroring the 
awarding and disbursement policies gov­
erning certain federal loans. Although the 
final regulations do not adopt this sugges­
tion, the IRS and Treasury Department 
believe that loans described by the com­
mentator probably would fall within the 
90-day safe harbor, or satisfy the “reason­
able period of time” requirement based on 
the facts and circumstances. 
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Another requirement of a “qualified ed­
ucation loan” is that the borrower obtain 
the loan “solely” to pay higher education 
expenses. One commentator suggested 
that if a taxpayer refinances a qualified 
education loan and receives an amount in 
excess of the original qualified education 
loan, the taxpayer may take an interest 
deduction under section 221 for interest 
paid on the refinanced loan. The com­
mentator is correct, but only if the tax­
payer uses the excess amount solely to pay 
higher education expenses and satisfies all 
other requirements of a qualified education 
loan. Thus, if the taxpayer uses the ex­
cess amount for any other purpose, the re­
financed loan is not “solely” to pay higher 
education expenses, and no interest paid on 
the loan will be deductible. 

5. Miscellaneous Comments and Changes 

Federal Postsecondary Education Loan 
Program — The final regulations clarify 
that a federal postsecondary education 
loan program includes, but is not limited 
to, the Federal Perkins Loan, Federal Fam­
ily Education Loan, and William D. Ford 
Federal Direct Loan Programs under Title 
IV of the Higher Education Act of 1965, 
and the Health Education Assistance Loan 
and the Nursing Student Loan Programs 
under Titles VII  and VIII of the  Public  
Health Service Act. 

Eligible Educational Institution — Al­
though the Higher Education Amendments 
Act of 1998 moved section 481 from Ti­
tle IV to Title I, the regulations do not re­
flect this change, as the statutory language 
refers to section 481 of the Higher Educa­
tion Act as in effect on the date that section 
221 was enacted. 

Interest Charges on a University 
In-House Deferred Payment Plan — One 
commentator requested clarification of 
the deductibility of interest charges on a 
university’s in-house deferred payment 
plan, which is a revolving credit account 
that can include a variety of expenditures 
in addition to qualified higher education 
expenses. This situation is addressed by 
Example 6 of §1.221–1(e)(4) and Example 
6 of §1.221–2(f)(4) concerning mixed use 
loans. 
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6. Refinanced and Consolidated Loans 

The final regulations reserve a place for 
more detailed treatment of refinanced and 
consolidated loans. 

7. Periods of Deferment or Forbearance 

Prior to the 2001 Act, section 221(d) 
stated that a “deduction shall be allowed 
under this section only with respect to in­
terest paid on any qualified education loan 
during the first 60 months (whether or nor 
consecutive) in which interest payments 
are required.” 

Some commentators recommended that 
the 60-month limitation period should not 
be suspended during a period of defer­
ment or forbearance. Other commentators 
suggested that the 60-month limitation pe­
riod should be suspended during all peri­
ods of deferment or forbearance, whether 
or not the taxpayer makes payments. Com­
mentators also asked whether rules un­
der which the 60-month period is not sus­
pended apply to loans made under federal 
programs as well as non-federal loans. Fi­
nally, commentators asked whether inter­
est payments made during periods of re­
duced payment forbearance are deductible. 

Section 221, prior to the 2001 Act, and 
the legislative history provide that only in­
terest payments required under the terms 
of a loan are deductible. Under that pro­
vision, interest a borrower pays voluntar­
ily during a period when payments are not 
required, such as during a period of defer­
ment or forbearance or before loan repay­
ment begins, is not deductible. 

Therefore, §1.221–2 of the final regu­
lations retains the rule that interest pay­
ments are not deductible if paid voluntar­
ily during a period of deferment or forbear­
ance. However, the final regulations pro­
vide that interest payments made during 
a period of deferment, forbearance, or re­
duced payment forbearance are deductible 
if required as part of the terms of the de­
ferment, forbearance, or reduced payment 
agreement. The final regulations include a 
new example involving reduced payment 
forbearance. 

In addition, §1.221–2 of the final reg­
ulations provides for suspension of the 
60-month period for loans not issued or 
guaranteed under a federal postsecondary 
education loan program under certain con­
ditions. The promissory note must contain 
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conditions for deferment or forbearance 
that are substantially similar to the condi­
tions established by the U.S. Department 
of Education for Federal student loan 
programs under Title IV of the Higher 
Education Act of 1965 and the borrower 
must satisfy one of those conditions. 

8. Start of the 60-Month Limitation Period 

A commentator expressed concern that 
the month a loan first enters repayment sta­
tus may not be the same as the month the 
first interest payment is required. Section 
1.221–2 of the final regulations clarifies 
that the beginning of the 60-month period 
commences on the first day of the month 
in which the first interest payment is re­
quired. 

9. Information Reporting for Interest 
Payments Received on Qualified 
Education Loans 

Section 6050S requires information 
reporting by certain lenders or other 
payees that receive payments of inter­
est on qualified education loans. Section 
1.6050S–3(b)(1) provides that interest in­
cludes stated interest, loan origination fees 
(other than fees for services), and capi­
talized interest. Section 1.6050S–3(e)(1) 
provides a special transitional rule for 
reporting loan origination fees and capital­
ized interest. Under the transitional rule, 
a payee is not required to report payments 
of loan origination fees and capitalized 
interest for loans made before January 1, 
2004. 

Several commentators representing 
payees requested that the transitional rule 
be extended because the necessary pro­
gramming changes to capture and report 
these amounts could not be made in the 
absence of final regulations under section 
221. Based on the comments received, 
these regulations amend §1.6050S–3(e)(1) 
to extend the transitional rule to loans 
made before September 1, 2004. 

Special Analyses 

It has been determined that this Trea­
sury decision is not a significant regula­
tory action as defined in Executive Order 
12866. Therefore, a regulatory assessment 
is not required. It also has been determined 
that section 553(b) of the Administrative 
Procedure Act (5 U.S.C. chapter 5) does 
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not apply to these regulations, and, be­
cause the regulations do not impose a col­
lection of information on small entities, the 
Regulatory Flexibility Act (5 U.S.C. chap­
ter 6) does not apply. Pursuant to section 
7805(f) of the Code, the proposed regula­
tions that preceded these regulations were 
submitted to the Chief Counsel for Advo­
cacy of the Small Business Administration 
for comment on its impact on small busi­
ness. 

Drafting Information 

The principal author of these final regu­
lations is Sean M. Dwyer, Office of the As­
sociate Chief Counsel (Income Tax & Ac­
counting). However, other personnel from 
the IRS and Treasury Department partici­
pated in their development. 

* * * * *  

Adoption of Amendments to the 
Regulations 

Accordingly, 26 CFR part 1 is amended 
as follows: 

PART 1—INCOME TAXES 

Paragraph 1. The authority citation for 
part 1 is amended by adding an entry in 
numerical order to read as follows: 

Authority: 26 U.S.C. 7805 * * * 
Section 1.221–2 also issued under 26 

U.S.C. 221(d). * * * 
Section 1.6050S–3 also issued under 26  

U.S.C. 6050S(g). * * * 
Par. 2. Sections 1.221–1 and 1.221–2 

are added to read as follows: 

§1.221–1 Deduction for interest paid on 
qualified education loans after December 
31, 2001. 

(a) In general—(1) Applicability. Un-
der section 221, an individual taxpayer 
may deduct from gross income certain in­
terest paid by the taxpayer during the tax­
able year on a qualified education loan. 
See paragraph (b)(4) of this section for 
rules on payments of interest by third par­
ties. The rules of this section are appli­
cable to periods governed by section 221 
as amended in 2001, which relates to de­
ductions for interest paid on qualified ed­
ucation loans after December 31, 2001, 
in taxable years ending after December 
31, 2001, and on or before December 31, 

2010. For rules applicable to interest due 
and paid on qualified education loans af­
ter January 21, 1999, if paid before Jan­
uary 1, 2002, see §1.221–2. Taxpayers 
also may apply §1.221–2 to interest due 
and paid on qualified education loans af­
ter December 31, 1997, but before January 
21, 1999. To the extent that the effective 
date limitation (sunset) of the 2001 amend­
ment remains in force unchanged, section 
221 before amendment in 2001, to which 
§1.221–2 relates, also applies to interest 
due and paid on qualified education loans 
in taxable years beginning after December 
31, 2010. 

(2) Example. The following example il­
lustrates the rules of this paragraph (a). In 
the example, assume that the institution the 
student attends is an eligible educational 
institution, the loan is a qualified educa­
tion loan, the student is legally obligated to 
make interest payments under the terms of 
the loan, and any other applicable require­
ments, if not otherwise specified, are ful­
filled. The example is as follows: 

Example. Effective dates. Student A begins to 
make monthly interest payments on her loan begin­
ning January 1, 1997. Student A continues to make 
interest payments in a timely fashion. However, un­
der the effective date provisions of section 221, no de­
duction is allowed for interest Student A pays prior to 
January 1, 1998. Student A may deduct interest due 
and paid on the loan after December 31, 1997. Stu­
dent A may apply the rules of §1.221–2 to interest 
due and paid during the period beginning January 1, 
1998, and ending January 20, 1999. Interest due and 
paid during the period January 21, 1999, and ending 
December 31, 2001, is deductible under the rules of 
§1.221–2, and interest paid after December 31, 2001, 
is deductible under the rules of this section. 

(b) Eligibility—(1) Taxpayer must have 
a legal obligation to make interest pay­
ments. A taxpayer is entitled to a deduc­
tion under section 221 only if the taxpayer 
has a legal obligation to make interest pay­
ments under the terms of the qualified ed­
ucation loan. 

(2) Claimed dependents not eligi-
ble—(i) In general. An individual is 
not entitled to a deduction under section 
221 for a taxable year if the individual is 
a dependent (as defined in section 152) 
for whom another taxpayer is allowed a 
deduction under section 151 on a Federal 
income tax return for the same taxable year 
(or, in the case of a fiscal year taxpayer, 
the taxable year beginning in the same 
calendar year as the individual’s taxable 
year). 

(ii) Examples. The following examples 
illustrate the rules of this paragraph (b)(2): 

Example 1. Student not claimed as dependent. 
Student B pays $750 of interest on qualified educa­
tion loans during 2003. Student B’s parents are not 
allowed a deduction for her as a dependent for 2003. 
Assuming fulfillment of all other relevant require­
ments, Student B may deduct under section 221 the 
$750 of interest paid in 2003. 

Example 2. Student claimed as dependent. Stu-
dent C pays $750 of interest on qualified education 
loans during 2003. Only Student C has the legal obli­
gation to make the payments. Student C’s parent 
claims him as a dependent and is allowed a deduction 
under section 151 with respect to Student C in com­
puting the parent’s 2003 Federal income tax. Student 
C is not entitled to a deduction under section 221 for 
the $750 of interest paid in 2003. Because Student 
C’s parent was not legally obligated to make the pay­
ments, Student C’s parent also is not entitled to a de­
duction for the interest. 

(3) Married taxpayers.  If a taxpayer is  
married as of the close of a taxable year, 
he or she is entitled to a deduction under 
this section only if the taxpayer and the 
taxpayer’s spouse file a joint return for that 
taxable year. 

(4) Payments of interest by a third party 
— (i)  In general. If a third party who is 
not legally obligated to make a payment 
of interest on a qualified education loan 
makes a payment of interest on behalf of a 
taxpayer who is legally obligated to make 
the payment, then the taxpayer is treated as 
receiving the payment from the third party 
and, in turn, paying the interest. 

(ii) Examples. The following examples 
illustrate the rules of this paragraph (b)(4): 

Example 1. Payment by employer. Student D 
obtains a qualified education loan to attend college. 
Upon Student D’s graduation from college, Student 
D works as an intern for a non-profit organization 
during which time Student D’s loan is in deferment 
and Student D makes no interest payments. As part 
of the internship program, the non-profit organization 
makes an interest payment on behalf of Student D 
after the deferment period. This payment is not ex­
cluded from Student D’s income under section 108(f) 
and is treated as additional compensation includible 
in Student D’s gross income. Assuming fulfillment 
of all other requirements of section 221, Student D 
may deduct this payment of interest for Federal in­
come tax purposes. 

Example 2. Payment by parent. Student E obtains 
a qualified education loan to attend college. Upon 
graduation from college, Student E makes legally re­
quired monthly payments of principal and interest. 
Student E’s mother makes a required monthly pay­
ment of interest as a gift to Student E. A deduction 
for Student E as a dependent is not allowed on an­
other taxpayer’s tax return for that taxable year. As­
suming fulfillment of all other requirements of sec­
tion 221, Student E may deduct this payment of in­
terest for Federal income tax purposes. 
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(c) Maximum deduction. The amount 
allowed as a deduction under section 
221 for any taxable year may not exceed 
$2,500. 

(d) Limitation based on modified ad­
justed gross income—(1) In general. 
The deduction allowed under section 
221 is phased out ratably for taxpayers 
with modified adjusted gross income be­
tween $50,000 and $65,000 ($100,000 and 
$130,000 for married individuals who file 
a joint return). Section 221 does not allow 
a deduction for taxpayers with modified 
adjusted gross income of $65,000 or above 
($130,000 or above for married individu­
als who file a joint return). See paragraph 
(d)(3) of this section for inflation adjust­
ment of amounts in this paragraph (d)(1). 

(2) Modified adjusted gross income de-
fined. The  term  modified adjusted gross in­
come means the adjusted gross income (as 
defined in section 62) of the taxpayer for 
the taxable year increased by any amount 
excluded from gross income under section 
911, 931, or 933 (relating to income earned 
abroad or from certain United States pos­
sessions or Puerto Rico). Modified ad­
justed gross income must be determined 
under this section after taking into account 
the inclusions, exclusions, deductions, and 
limitations provided by sections 86 (social 
security and tier 1 railroad retirement ben­
efits), 135 (redemption of qualified United 
States savings bonds), 137 (adoption assis­
tance programs), 219 (deductible qualified 
retirement contributions), and 469 (limi­
tation on passive activity losses and cred­
its), but before taking into account the de­
ductions provided by sections 221 and 222 
(qualified tuition and related expenses). 

(3) Inflation adjustment. For taxable 
years beginning after 2002, the amounts 
in paragraph (d)(1) of this section will 
be increased for inflation occurring after 
2001 in accordance with section 221(f)(1). 
If any amount adjusted under section 
221(f)(1) is not a multiple of $5,000, the 
amount will be rounded to the next lowest 
multiple of $5,000. 

(e) Definitions—(1) Eligible educa­
tional institution. In general, an eligible 
educational institution means any col­
lege, university, vocational school, or 
other postsecondary educational institu­
tion described in section 481 of the Higher 
Education Act of 1965 (20 U.S.C. 1088), 
as in effect on August 5, 1997, and certi­
fied by the U.S. Department of Education 
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as eligible to participate in student aid 
programs administered by the Depart­
ment, as described in section 25A(f)(2) 
and §1.25A–2(b). For purposes of this 
section, an eligible educational institution 
also includes an institution that conducts 
an internship or residency program lead­
ing to a degree or certificate awarded by 
an institution, a hospital, or a health care 
facility that offers postgraduate training. 

(2) Qualified higher education ex-
penses—(i) In general. Qualified higher 
education expenses means the cost of at­
tendance (as defined in section 472 of the 
Higher Education Act of 1965, 20 U.S.C. 
1087ll, as in effect on August 4, 1997), at 
an eligible educational institution, reduced 
by the amounts described in paragraph 
(e)(2)(ii) of this section. Consistent with 
section 472 of the Higher Education Act 
of 1965, a student’s cost of attendance 
is determined by the eligible educational 
institution and includes tuition and fees 
normally assessed a student carrying the 
same academic workload as the student, 
an allowance for room and board, and an 
allowance for books, supplies, transporta­
tion, and miscellaneous expenses of the 
student. 

(ii) Reductions. Qualified higher ed­
ucation expenses are reduced by any 
amount that is paid to or on behalf of a 
student with respect to such expenses and 
that is— 

(A) A qualified scholarship that is ex­
cludable from income under section 117; 

(B) An educational assistance al­
lowance for a veteran or member of the 
armed forces under chapter 30, 31, 32, 
34 or 35 of title 38, United States Code, 
or under chapter 1606 of title 10, United 
States Code; 

(C) Employer-provided educational as­
sistance that is excludable from income 
under section 127; 

(D) Any other amount that is de­
scribed in section 25A(g)(2)(C) (relating 
to amounts excludable from gross income 
as educational assistance); 

(E) Any otherwise includible amount 
excluded from gross income under section 
135 (relating to the redemption of United 
States savings bonds); 

(F) Any otherwise includible amount 
distributed from a Coverdell education 
savings account and excluded from gross 
income under section 530(d)(2); or 
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(G) Any otherwise includible amount 
distributed from a qualified tuition pro­
gram and excluded from gross income un­
der section 529(c)(3)(B). 

(3) Qualified education loan—(i) In 
general. A  qualified education loan means 
indebtedness incurred by a taxpayer solely 
to pay qualified higher education expenses 
that are— 

(A) Incurred on behalf of a student who 
is the taxpayer, the taxpayer’s spouse, or 
a dependent (as defined in section 152) of 
the taxpayer at the time the taxpayer incurs 
the indebtedness; 

(B) Attributable to education provided 
during an academic period, as described in 
section 25A and the regulations thereun­
der, when the student is an eligible student 
as defined in section 25A(b)(3) (requir­
ing that the student be a degree candidate 
carrying at least half the normal full-time 
workload); and 

(C) Paid or incurred within a reasonable 
period of time before or after the taxpayer 
incurs the indebtedness. 

(ii) Reasonable Period. Except as 
otherwise provided in this paragraph 
(e)(3)(ii), what constitutes a reasonable 
period of time for purposes of paragraph 
(e)(3)(i)(C) of this section generally is 
determined based on all the relevant facts 
and circumstances. However, qualified 
higher education expenses are treated as 
paid or incurred within a reasonable period 
of time before or after the taxpayer incurs 
the indebtedness if— 

(A) The expenses are paid with the pro­
ceeds of education loans that are part of a 
Federal postsecondary education loan pro-
gram; or 

(B) The expenses relate to a particu­
lar academic period and the loan proceeds 
used to pay the expenses are disbursed 
within a period that begins 90 days prior to 
the start of that academic period and ends 
90 days after the end of that academic pe­
riod. 

(iii) Related party. A qualified educa­
tion loan does not include any indebted­
ness owed to a person who is related to 
the taxpayer, within the meaning of section 
267(b) or 707(b)(1). For example, a parent 
or grandparent of the taxpayer is a related 
person. In addition, a qualified education 
loan does not include a loan made under 
any qualified employer plan as defined in 
section 72(p)(4) or under any contract re­
ferred to in section 72(p)(5). 
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(iv) Federal issuance or guarantee not 
required. A loan does not have to be is­
sued or guaranteed under a Federal post­
secondary education loan program to be a 
qualified education loan. 

(v) Refinanced and consolidated in-
debtedness—(A) In general. A qualified 
education loan includes indebtedness in­
curred solely to refinance a qualified 
education loan. A qualified education 
loan includes a single, consolidated in­
debtedness incurred solely to refinance 
two or more qualified education loans of 
a borrower. 

(B) Treatment of refinanced and consol­
idated indebtedness. [Reserved.] 

(4) Examples. The following examples 
illustrate the rules of this paragraph (e): 

Example 1. Eligible educational institution. Uni-
versity F is a postsecondary educational institution 
described in section 481 of the Higher Education Act 
of 1965. The U.S. Department of Education has certi­
fied that University F is eligible to participate in fed­
eral financial aid programs administered by that De­
partment, although University F chooses not to par­
ticipate. University F is an eligible educational insti­
tution. 

Example 2. Qualified higher education expenses. 
Student G receives a $3,000 qualified scholarship for 
the 2003 fall semester that is excludable from Student 
G’s gross income under section 117. Student G re­
ceives no other forms of financial assistance with re­
spect to the 2003 fall semester. Student G’s cost of at­
tendance for the 2003 fall semester, as determined by 
Student G’s eligible educational institution for pur­
poses of calculating a student’s financial need in ac­
cordance with section 472 of the Higher Education 
Act, is $16,000. For the 2003 fall semester, Student 
G has qualified higher education expenses of $13,000 
(the cost of attendance as determined by the institu­
tion ($16,000) reduced by the qualified scholarship 
proceeds excludable from gross income ($3,000)). 

Example 3. Qualified education loan. Student H 
borrows money from a commercial bank to pay qual­
ified higher education expenses related to his enroll­
ment on a half-time basis in a graduate program at an 
eligible educational institution. Student H uses all the 
loan proceeds to pay qualified higher education ex­
penses incurred within a reasonable period of time af­
ter incurring the indebtedness. The loan is not feder­
ally guaranteed. The commercial bank is not related 
to Student H within the meaning of section 267(b) or 
707(b)(1). Student H’s loan is a qualified education 
loan within the meaning of section 221. 

Example 4. Qualified education loan. Student 
I signs a promissory note for a loan on August 15, 
2003, to pay for qualified higher education expenses 
for the 2003 fall and 2004 spring semesters. On Au­
gust 20, 2003, the lender disburses loan proceeds to 
Student I’s college. The college credits them to Stu­
dent I’s account to pay qualified higher education ex­
penses for the 2003 fall semester, which begins on 
August 25, 2003. On January 26, 2004, the lender 
disburses additional loan proceeds to Student I’s col­
lege. The college credits them to Student I’s ac­
count to pay qualified higher education expenses for 
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the 2004 spring semester, which began on January 
12, 2004. Student I’s qualified higher education ex­
penses for the two semesters are paid within a rea­
sonable period of time, as the first loan disbursement 
occurred within the 90 days prior to the start of the 
fall 2003 semester and the second loan disbursement 
occurred during the spring 2004 semester. 

Example 5. Qualified education loan. The facts 
are the same as in Example 4 except that in 2005 the 
college is not an eligible educational institution be­
cause it loses its eligibility to participate in certain 
federal financial aid programs administered by the 
U.S. Department of Education. The qualification of 
Student I’s loan, which was used to pay for qualified 
higher education expenses for the 2003 fall and 2004 
spring semesters, as a qualified education loan is not 
affected by the college’s subsequent loss of eligibil­
ity. 

Example 6. Mixed-use loans. Student J signs a 
promissory note for a loan secured by Student J’s per­
sonal residence. Student J will use part of the loan 
proceeds to pay for certain improvements to Student 
J’s residence and part of the loan proceeds to pay 
qualified higher education expenses of Student J’s 
spouse. Because Student J obtains the loan not solely 
to pay qualified higher education expenses, the loan 
is not a qualified education loan. 

(f) Interest—(1) In general. Amounts  
paid on a qualified education loan are de­
ductible under section 221 if the amounts 
are interest for federal income tax pur­
poses. For example, interest includes— 

(i) Qualified stated interest (as defined 
in §1.1273–1(c)); and 

(ii) Original issue discount, which gen­
erally includes capitalized interest. For 
purposes of section 221, capitalized inter­
est means any accrued and unpaid interest 
on a qualified education loan that, in accor­
dance with the terms of the loan, is added 
by the lender to the outstanding principal 
balance of the loan. 

(2) Operative rules for original issue 
discount—(i) In general. The  rules  to  de­
termine the amount of original issue dis­
count on a loan and the accruals of the dis­
count are in sections 163(e), 1271 through 
1275, and the regulations thereunder. In 
general, original issue discount is the ex­
cess of a loan’s stated redemption price at 
maturity (all payments due under the loan 
other than qualified stated interest pay­
ments) over its issue price (the amount 
loaned). Although original issue discount 
generally is deductible as it accrues under 
section 163(e) and §1.163–7, original is­
sue discount on a qualified education loan 
is not deductible until paid. See paragraph 
(f)(3) of this section to determine when 
original issue discount is paid. 

(ii) Treatment of loan origination fees 
by the borrower. If a loan origination fee 
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is paid by the borrower other than for prop­
erty or services provided by the lender, 
the fee reduces the issue price of the loan, 
which creates original issue discount (or 
additional original issue discount) on the 
loan in an amount equal to the fee. See 
§1.1273–2(g). For an example of how a 
loan origination fee is taken into account, 
see Example 2 of paragraph (f)(4) of this 
section. 

(3) Allocation of payments.  See  
§§1.446–2(e) and 1.1275–2(a) for rules 
on allocating payments between interest 
and principal. In general, these rules treat 
a payment first as a payment of interest to 
the extent of the interest that has accrued 
and remains unpaid as of the date the pay­
ment is due, and second as a payment of 
principal. The characterization of a pay­
ment as either interest or principal under 
these rules applies regardless of how the 
parties label the payment (either as interest 
or principal). Accordingly, the taxpayer 
may deduct the portion of a payment la­
beled as principal that these rules treat as 
a payment of interest on the loan, includ­
ing any portion attributable to capitalized 
interest or loan origination fees. 

(4) Examples. The following examples 
illustrate the rules of this paragraph (f). 
In the examples, assume that the institu­
tion the student attends is an eligible ed­
ucational institution, the loan is a qualified 
education loan, the student is legally obli­
gated to make interest payments under the 
terms of the loan, and any other applica­
ble requirements, if not otherwise speci­
fied, are fulfilled. The examples are as fol­
lows: 

Example 1. Capitalized interest. Interest on Stu­
dent K’s loan accrues while Student K is in school, 
but Student K is not required to make any payments 
on the loan until six months after he graduates or oth­
erwise leaves school. At that time, the lender capi­
talizes all accrued but unpaid interest and adds it to 
the outstanding principal amount of the loan. There­
after, Student K is required to make monthly pay­
ments of interest and principal on the loan. The inter­
est payable on the loan, including the capitalized in­
terest, is original issue discount. See section 1273 and 
the regulations thereunder. Therefore, in determining 
the total amount of interest paid on the loan each tax­
able year, Student K may deduct any payments that 
§1.1275–2(a) treats as payments of interest, including 
any principal payments that are treated as payments 
of capitalized interest. See paragraph (f)(3) of this 
section. 

Example 2. Allocation of payments. The facts 
are the same as in Example 1, except that, in addi­
tion, the lender charges Student K a loan origination 
fee, which is not for any property or services pro­
vided by the lender. Under §1.1273–2(g), the loan 
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origination fee reduces the issue price of the loan, 
which reduction increases the amount of original is­
sue discount on the loan by the amount of the fee. The 
amount of original issue discount (which includes the 
capitalized interest and loan origination fee) that ac­
crues each year is determined under section 1272 and 
§1.1272–1. In effect, the loan origination fee ac­
crues over the entire term of the loan. Because the 
loan has original issue discount, the payment order­
ing rules in §1.1275–2(a) must be used to determine 
how much of each payment is interest for federal tax 
purposes. See paragraph (f)(3) of this section. Under 
§1.1275–2(a), each payment (regardless of its desig­
nation by the parties as either interest or principal) 
generally is treated first as a payment of original issue 
discount, to the extent of the original issue discount 
that has accrued as of the date the payment is due and 
has not been allocated to prior payments, and second 
as a payment of principal. Therefore, in determining 
the total amount of interest paid on the qualified edu­
cation loan for a taxable year, Student K may deduct 
any payments that the parties label as principal but 
that are treated as payments of original issue discount 
under §1.1275–2(a). 

(g) Additional Rules—(1) Payment of 
interest made during period when interest 
payment not required. Payments of inter­
est on a qualified education loan to which 
this section is applicable are deductible 
even if the payments are made during a 
period when interest payments are not re­
quired because, for example, the loan has 
not yet entered repayment status or is in a 
period of deferment or forbearance. 

(2) Denial of double benefit. No  deduc­
tion is allowed under this section for any 
amount for which a deduction is allowable 
under another provision of Chapter 1 of the 
Internal Revenue Code. No deduction is 
allowed under this section for any amount 
for which an exclusion is allowable under 
section 108(f) (relating to cancellation of 
indebtedness). 

(3) Examples. The following examples 
illustrate the rules of this paragraph (g). 
In the examples, assume that the institu­
tion the student attends is an eligible ed­
ucational institution, the loan is a qualified 
education loan, and the student is legally 
obligated to make interest payments under 
the terms  of  the loan:  

Example 1. Voluntary payment of interest before 
loan has entered repayment status. Student L obtains 
a loan to attend college. The terms of the loan pro­
vide that interest accrues on the loan while Student L 
earns his undergraduate degree but that Student L is 
not required to begin making payments of interest un­
til six full calendar months after he graduates or oth­
erwise leaves school. Nevertheless, Student L volun­
tarily pays interest on the loan during 2003, while en­
rolled in college. Assuming all other relevant require­
ments are met, Student L is allowed a deduction for 
interest paid while attending college even though the 

payments were made before interest payments were 
required. 

Example 2. Voluntary payment during period of 
deferment or forbearance. The facts are the same as 
in Example 2, except that Student L makes no pay­
ments on the loan while enrolled in college. Student 
L graduates in June 2003 and begins making monthly 
payments of principal and interest on the loan in Jan­
uary 2004, as required by the terms of the loan. In 
August 2004, Student L enrolls in graduate school on 
a full-time basis. Under the terms of the loan, Stu­
dent L may apply for deferment of the loan payments 
while Student L is enrolled in graduate school. Stu­
dent L applies for and receives a deferment on the out­
standing loan. However, Student L continues to make 
some monthly payments of interest during graduate 
school. Student L may deduct interest paid on the 
loan during the period beginning in January 2004, in­
cluding interest paid while Student L is enrolled in 
graduate school. 

(h) Effective date.  This section is appli­
cable to periods governed by section 221 
as amended in 2001, which relates to inter­
est paid on a qualified education loan after 
December 31, 2001, in taxable years end­
ing after December 31, 2001, and on or be­
fore December 31, 2010. 

§1.221–2 Deduction for interest due and 
paid on qualified education loans before 
January 1, 2002. 

(a) In general. Under section 221, an 
individual taxpayer may deduct from gross 
income certain interest due and paid by the 
taxpayer during the taxable year on a qual­
ified education loan. The deduction is al­
lowed only with respect to interest due and 
paid on a qualified education loan during 
the first 60 months that interest payments 
are required under the terms of the loan. 
See paragraph (e) of this section for rules 
relating to the 60-month rule. See para­
graph (b)(4) of this section for rules on 
payments of interest by third parties. The 
rules of this section are applicable to in­
terest due and paid on qualified education 
loans after January 21, 1999, if paid before 
January 1, 2002. Taxpayers also may ap­
ply the rules of this section to interest due 
and paid on qualified education loans after 
December 31, 1997, but before January 21, 
1999. To the extent that the effective date 
limitation (“sunset”) of the 2001 amend­
ment remains in force unchanged, section 
221 before amendment in 2001, to which 
this section relates, also applies to interest 
due and paid on qualified education loans 
in taxable years beginning after Decem­
ber 31, 2010. For rules applicable to peri­
ods governed by section 221 as amended in 

2001, which relates to deductions for inter­
est paid on qualified education loans after 
December 31, 2001, in taxable years end­
ing after December 31, 2001, and before 
January 1, 2011, see §1.221–1. 

(b) Eligibility—(1) Taxpayer must have 
a legal obligation to make interest pay­
ments. A taxpayer is entitled to a deduc­
tion under section 221 only if the taxpayer 
has a legal obligation to make interest pay­
ments under the terms of the qualified ed­
ucation loan. 

(2) Claimed dependents not eligi-
ble—(i) In general. An individual is 
not entitled to a deduction under section 
221 for a taxable year if the individual is 
a dependent (as defined in section 152) 
for whom another taxpayer is allowed a 
deduction under section 151 on a Federal 
income tax return for the same taxable year 
(or, in the case of a fiscal year taxpayer, 
the taxable year beginning in the same 
calendar year as the individual’s taxable 
year). 

(ii) Examples. The following examples 
illustrate the rules of this paragraph (b)(2): 

Example 1. Student not claimed as dependent. 
Student A pays $750 of interest on qualified educa­
tion loans during 1998. Student A’s parents are not 
allowed a deduction for her as a dependent for 1998. 
Assuming fulfillment of all other relevant require­
ments, Student A may deduct the $750 of interest paid 
in 1998 under section 221. 

Example 2. Student claimed as dependent. Stu-
dent B pays $750 of interest on qualified education 
loans during 1998. Only Student B has the legal obli­
gation to make the payments. Student B’s parent 
claims him as a dependent and is allowed a deduction 
under section 151 with respect to Student B in com­
puting the parent’s 1998 Federal income tax. Student 
B may not deduct the $750 of interest paid in 1998 
under section 221. Because Student B’s parent was 
not legally obligated to make the payments, Student 
B’s parent also  may not deduct the  interest.  

(3) Married taxpayers.  If a taxpayer is  
married as of the close of a taxable year, 
he or she is entitled to a deduction under 
this section only if the taxpayer and the 
taxpayer’s spouse file a joint return for that 
taxable year. 

(4) Payments of interest by a third 
party—(i) In general. If a third party who 
is not legally obligated to make a payment 
of interest on a qualified education loan 
makes a payment of interest on behalf of a 
taxpayer who is legally obligated to make 
the payment, then the taxpayer is treated 
as receiving the payment from the third 
party and, in turn, paying the interest. 

(ii) Examples. The following examples 
illustrate the rules of this paragraph (b)(4): 
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Example 1. Payment by employer. Student C 
obtains a qualified education loan to attend college. 
Upon Student C’s graduation from college, Student C 
works as an intern for a non-profit organization dur­
ing which time Student C’s loan is in deferment and 
Student C makes no interest payments. As part of 
the internship program, the non-profit organization 
makes an interest payment on behalf of Student C 
after the deferment period. This payment is not ex­
cluded from Student C’s income under section 108(f) 
and is treated as additional compensation includible 
in Student C’s gross income. Assuming fulfillment of 

all other requirements of section 221, Student C may 
deduct this payment of interest for Federal income tax 
purposes. 

Example 2. Payment by parent. Student D obtains 
a qualified education loan to attend college. Upon 
graduation from college, Student D makes legally re­
quired monthly payments of principal and interest. 
Student D’s mother makes a required monthly pay­
ment of interest as a gift to Student D. A deduction 
for Student D as a dependent is not allowed on an­
other taxpayer’s tax return for that taxable year. As­
suming fulfillment of all other requirements of sec­

tion 221, Student D may deduct this payment of in­
terest for Federal income tax purposes. 

(c) Maximum deduction. In any taxable 
year beginning before January 1, 2002, the 
amount allowed as a deduction under sec­
tion 221 may not exceed the amount de­
termined in accordance with the following 
table: 

Taxable Year Beginning in Maximum Deduction 

1998 $1,000 

1999 $1,500 

2000 $2,000 

2001 $2,500 

(d) Limitation based on modified ad­
justed gross income—(1) In general. 
The deduction allowed under section 
221 is phased out ratably for taxpayers 
with modified adjusted gross income be­
tween $40,000 and $55,000 ($60,000 and 
$75,000 for married individuals who file a 
joint return). Section 221 does not allow 
a deduction for taxpayers with modified 
adjusted gross income of $55,000 or above 
($75,000 or above for married individuals 
who file a joint return). 

(2) Modified adjusted gross income de-
fined. The  term  modified adjusted gross in­
come means the adjusted gross income (as 
defined in section 62) of the taxpayer for 
the taxable year increased by any amount 
excluded from gross income under section 
911, 931, or 933 (relating to income earned 
abroad or from certain United States pos­
sessions or Puerto Rico). Modified ad­
justed gross income must be determined 
under this section after taking into account 
the inclusions, exclusions, deductions, and 
limitations provided by sections 86 (social 
security and tier 1 railroad retirement ben­
efits), 135 (redemption of qualified United 
States savings bonds), 137 (adoption assis­
tance programs), 219 (deductible qualified 
retirement contributions), and 469 (limita­
tion on passive activity losses and credits), 
but before taking into account the deduc­
tion provided by section 221. 

(e) 60-month rule—(1) In general. A  
deduction for interest paid on a qualified 
education loan is allowed only for pay­
ments made during the first 60 months that 
interest payments are required on the loan. 

June 7, 2004 

The 60-month period begins on the  first  
day of the month that includes the date 
on which interest payments are first re­
quired and ends 60 months later, unless 
the 60-month period is suspended for pe­
riods of deferment or forbearance within 
the meaning of paragraph (e)(3) of this sec­
tion. The 60-month period continues to 
run regardless of whether the required in­
terest payments are actually made. The 
date on which the first interest payment is 
required is determined under the terms of 
the loan agreement or, in the case of a loan 
issued or guaranteed under a federal post­
secondary education loan program (such 
as loan programs under Title IV of the 
Higher Education Act of 1965 (20 U.S.C. 
1070) and Titles VII and VIII of the Public 
Health Service Act (42 U.S.C. 292, and 42 
U.S.C. 296) under applicable Federal reg­
ulations. For a discussion of interest, see 
paragraph (h) of this section. For special 
rules relating to loan refinancings, consol­
idated loans, and collapsed loans, see para­
graph (i) of this section. 

(2) Loans that entered repayment sta­
tus prior to January 1, 1998. In the case of 
any qualified education loan that entered 
repayment status prior to January 1, 1998, 
section 221 allows no deduction for inter­
est paid during the portion of the 60-month 
period described in paragraph (e)(1) of this 
section that occurred prior to January 1, 
1998. Section 221 allows a deduction only 
for interest due and paid during that por­
tion, if any, of the 60-month period remain­
ing after December 31, 1997. 
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(3) Periods of deferment or forbear­
ance. The 60-month period described in 
paragraph (e)(1) of this section generally 
is suspended for any period when inter­
est payments are not required on a quali­
fied education loan because the lender has 
granted the taxpayer a period of deferment 
or forbearance (including postponement in 
anticipation of cancellation). However, in 
the case of a qualified education loan that 
is not issued or guaranteed under a Federal 
postsecondary education loan program, the 
60-month period will be suspended under 
this paragraph (e)(3) only if the promis­
sory note contains conditions substantially 
similar to the conditions for deferment or 
forbearance established by the U.S. De­
partment of Education for Federal student 
loan programs under Title IV of the Higher 
Education Act of 1965, such as half-time 
study at a postsecondary educational in­
stitution, study in an approved graduate 
fellowship program or in an approved re­
habilitation program for the disabled, in­
ability to find full-time employment, eco­
nomic hardship, or the performance of ser­
vices in certain occupations or federal pro­
grams, and the borrower satisfies one of 
those conditions. For any qualified educa­
tion loan, the 60-month period is not sus­
pended if under the terms of the loan inter­
est continues to accrue while the loan is in 
deferment or forbearance and either— 

(i) In the case of deferment, the tax­
payer agrees to pay interest currently dur­
ing the deferment period; or 

(ii) In the case of forbearance, the tax­
payer agrees to make reduced payments, or 
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payments of interest only, during the for­
bearance period. 

(4) Late payments. A deduction is al­
lowed for a payment of interest required in 
one month but actually made in a subse­
quent month prior to the expiration of the 
60-month period. A deduction is not al­
lowed for a payment of interest required 
in one month but actually made in a sub­
sequent month after the expiration of the 
60-month period. A late payment made 
during a period of deferment or forbear­
ance is treated, solely for purposes of de­
termining whether it is made during the 
60-month period, as made on the date it is 
due. 

(5) Examples. The following examples 
illustrate the rules of this paragraph (e). 
In the examples, assume that the institu­
tion the student attends is an eligible ed­
ucational institution, the loan is a quali­
fied education loan and is issued or guar­
anteed under a federal postsecondary edu­
cation loan program, the student is legally 
obligated to make interest payments under 
the terms of the loan, the interest payments 
occur after December 31, 1997, but before 
January 1, 2002, and with respect to any 
period after December 31, 1997, but be­
fore January 21, 1999, the taxpayer elects 
to apply the rules of this section. The ex­
amples are as follows: 

Example 1. Payment prior to 60-month period. 
Student E obtains a loan to attend college. The terms 
of the loan provide that interest accrues on the loan 
while Student E earns his undergraduate degree but 
that Student E is not required to begin making pay­
ments of interest until six full calendar months af­
ter he graduates. Nevertheless, Student E voluntarily 
pays interest on the loan while attending college. Stu­
dent E is not allowed a deduction for interest paid dur­
ing that period, because those payments were made 
prior to the start of the 60-month period. Similarly, 
Student E would not be allowed a deduction for any 
interest paid during the six month grace period after 
graduation when interest payments are not required. 

Example 2. Deferment option not exercised. The  
facts are the same as in Example 1 except that Stu­
dent E makes no payments on the loan while enrolled 
in college. Student E graduates in June 1999, and is 
required to begin making monthly payments of prin­
cipal and interest on the loan in January 2000. The 
60-month period described in paragraph (e)(1) of this 
section begins in January 2000. In August 2000, Stu­
dent E enrolls in graduate school on a full-time ba­
sis. Under the terms of the loan, Student E may 
apply for deferment of the loan payments while en­
rolled in graduate school. However, Student E elects 
not to apply for deferment and continues to make re­
quired monthly payments on the loan during graduate 
school. Assuming fulfillment of all other relevant re­
quirements, Student E may deduct interest paid on the 
loan during the 60-month period beginning in January 

2000, including interest paid while enrolled in grad­
uate school. 

Example 3. Late payment, within 60-month pe­
riod. The facts are the same as in Example 2 except 
that, after the loan enters repayment status in Jan­
uary 2000, Student E makes no interest payments un­
til March 2000. In March 2000, Student E pays inter­
est required for the months of January, February, and 
March 2000. Assuming fulfillment of all other rele­
vant requirements, Student E may deduct the interest 
paid in March for the months of January, February, 
and March because the interest payments are required 
under the terms of the loan and are paid within the 
60-month period, even though the January and Feb­
ruary interest payments may be late. 

Example 4. Late payment during deferment but 
within 60-month period. The terms of Student F’s 
loan require her to begin making monthly payments 
of interest on the loan in January 2000. The 60-month 
period described in paragraph (e)(1) of this section 
begins in January 2000. Student F fails to make the 
required interest payments for the months of Novem­
ber and December 2000. In January 2001, Student F 
enrolls in graduate school on a half-time basis. Un­
der the terms of the loan, Student F obtains a de­
ferment of the loan payments due while enrolled in 
graduate school. The deferment becomes effective 
January 1, 2001. In March 2001, while the loan is 
in deferment, Student F pays the interest due for the 
months of November and December 2000. Assuming 
fulfillment of all other relevant requirements, Student 
F may deduct interest paid in March 2001, for the 
months of November and December 2000, because 
the late interest payments are treated, solely for pur­
poses of determining whether they were made during 
the 60-month period, as made in November and De­
cember 2000. 

Example 5. 60-month period. The terms of Stu­
dent G’s loan require him to begin making monthly 
payments of interest on the loan in November 1999. 
The 60-month period described in paragraph (e)(1) 
of this section begins in November 1999. In Jan­
uary 2000, Student G enrolls in graduate school on 
a half-time basis. As permitted under the terms of the 
loan, Student G applies for deferment of the loan pay­
ments due while enrolled in graduate school. While 
awaiting formal approval from the lender of his re­
quest for deferment, Student G pays interest due for 
the month of January 2000. In February 2000, the 
lender approves Student G’s request for deferment, 
effective as of January 1, 2000. Assuming fulfill­
ment of all other relevant requirements, Student G 
may deduct interest paid in January 2000, prior to his 
receipt of the lender’s approval, even though the de­
ferment was retroactive to January 1, 2000. As of 
February 2000, there are 57 months remaining in the 
60-month period for that loan. Because Student G is 
not required to make interest payments during the pe­
riod of deferment, the 60-month period is suspended. 
After January 2000, Student G may not deduct any 
voluntary payments of interest made during the pe­
riod of deferment. 

Example 6. 60-month period. The terms of Stu­
dent H’s loan require her to begin making monthly 
payments of interest on the loan in November 1999. 
The 60-month period described in paragraph (e)(1) 
of this section begins in November 1999. In Jan­
uary 2000, Student H enrolls in graduate school on 
a half-time basis. As permitted under the terms of 

the loan, Student H applies to make reduced pay­
ments of principal and interest while enrolled in grad­
uate school. After the lender approves her applica­
tion, Student H pays principal and interest due for the 
month of January 2000 at the reduced rate. Assuming 
fulfillment of all other relevant requirements, Student 
H may deduct interest paid in January 2000. As of 
February 2000, there are 57 months remaining in the 
60-month period for that loan. 

Example 7. Reduction of 60-month period for 
months prior to January 1, 1998. The first payment 
of interest on a loan is due in January 1997. There­
after, interest payments are required on a monthly 
basis. The 60-month period described in paragraph 
(e)(1) of this section for this loan begins on January 
1, 1997, the first day of the month that includes the 
date on which the first interest payment is required. 
However, the borrower may not deduct interest paid 
prior to January 1, 1998, under the effective date pro­
visions of section 221. Assuming fulfillment of all 
other relevant requirements, the borrower may deduct 
interest due and paid on the loan during the 48 months 
beginning on January 1, 1998 (unless such period is 
extended for periods of deferment or forbearance un­
der paragraph (e)(3) of this section). 

(f) Definitions—(1) Eligible educa­
tional institution. In general, an eligible 
educational institution means any college, 
university, vocational school, or other 
post-secondary educational institution 
described in section 481 of the Higher 
Education Act of 1965, 20 U.S.C. 1088, 
as in effect on August 5, 1997, and certi­
fied by the U.S. Department of Education 
as eligible to participate in student aid 
programs administered by the Depart­
ment, as described in section 25A(f)(2) 
and § 1.25A–2(b). For purposes of this 
section, an eligible educational institution 
also includes an institution that conducts 
an internship or residency program lead­
ing to a degree or certificate awarded by 
an institution, a hospital, or a health care 
facility that offers postgraduate training. 

(2) Qualified higher education ex-
penses—(i) In general. Qualified higher 
education expenses means the cost of at­
tendance (as defined in section 472 of the 
Higher Education Act of 1965, 20 U.S.C. 
1087ll, as in effect on August 4, 1997), at 
an eligible educational institution, reduced 
by the amounts described in paragraph 
(f)(2)(ii) of this section. Consistent with 
section 472 of the Higher Education Act 
of 1965, a student’s cost of attendance 
is determined by the eligible educational 
institution and includes tuition and fees 
normally assessed a student carrying the 
same academic workload as the student, 
an allowance for room and board, and an 
allowance for books, supplies, transporta-
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tion, and miscellaneous expenses of the 
student. 

(ii) Reductions. Qualified higher ed­
ucation expenses are reduced by any 
amount that is paid to or on behalf of a 
student with respect to such expenses and 
that is— 

(A) A qualified scholarship that is ex­
cludable from income under section 117; 

(B) An educational assistance al­
lowance for a veteran or member of the 
armed forces under chapter 30, 31, 32, 
34 or 35 of title 38, United States Code, 
or under chapter 1606 of title 10, United 
States Code; 

(C) Employer-provided educational as­
sistance that is excludable from income 
under section 127; 

(D) Any other amount that is de­
scribed in section 25A(g)(2)(C) (relating 
to amounts excludable from gross income 
as educational assistance); 

(E) Any otherwise includible amount 
excluded from gross income under section 
135 (relating to the redemption of United 
States savings bonds); or 

(F) Any otherwise includible amount 
distributed from a Coverdell education 
savings account and excluded from gross 
income under section 530(d)(2). 

(3) Qualified education loan—(i) In 
general. A  qualified education loan means 
indebtedness incurred by a taxpayer solely 
to pay qualified higher education expenses 
that are— 

(A) Incurred on behalf of a student  who  
is the taxpayer, the taxpayer’s spouse, or 
a dependent (as defined in section 152) of 
the taxpayer at the time the taxpayer incurs 
the indebtedness; 

(B) Attributable to education provided 
during an academic period, as described in 
section 25A and the regulations thereun­
der, when the student is an eligible student 
as defined in section 25A(b)(3) (requir­
ing that the student be a degree candidate 
carrying at least half the normal full-time 
workload); and 

(C) Paid or incurred within a reasonable 
period of time before or after the taxpayer 
incurs the indebtedness. 

(ii) Reasonable period. Except as 
otherwise provided in this paragraph 
(f)(3)(ii), what constitutes a reasonable 
period of time for purposes of paragraph 
(f)(3)(i)(C) of this section generally is 
determined based on all the relevant facts 
and circumstances. However, qualified 
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higher education expenses are treated as 
paid or incurred within a reasonable period 
of time before or after the taxpayer incurs 
the indebtedness if— 

(A) The expenses are paid with the pro­
ceeds of education loans that are part of a 
federal postsecondary education loan pro­
gram; or 

(B) The expenses relate to a particu­
lar academic period and the loan proceeds 
used to pay the expenses are disbursed 
within a period that begins 90 days prior to 
the start of that academic period and ends 
90 days after the end of that academic pe­
riod. 

(iii) Related party. A qualified educa­
tion loan does not include any indebted­
ness owed to a person who is related to 
the taxpayer, within the meaning of section 
267(b) or 707(b)(1). For example, a parent 
or grandparent of the taxpayer is a related 
person. In addition, a qualified education 
loan does not include a loan made under 
any qualified employer plan as defined in 
section 72(p)(4) or under any contract re­
ferred to in section 72(p)(5). 

(iv) Federal issuance or guarantee not 
required. A loan does not have to be is­
sued or guaranteed under a federal post­
secondary education loan program to be a 
qualified education loan. 

(v) Refinanced and consolidated in-
debtedness—(A) In general. A qualified 
education loan includes indebtedness in­
curred solely to refinance a qualified 
education loan. A qualified education 
loan includes a single, consolidated in­
debtedness incurred solely to refinance 
two or more qualified education loans of 
a borrower. 

(B) Treatment of refinanced and consol­
idated indebtedness. [Reserved.] 

(4) Examples. The following examples 
illustrate the rules of this paragraph (f): 

Example 1. Eligible educational institution. Uni-
versity J is a postsecondary educational institution de­
scribed in section 481 of the Higher Education Act of 
1965. The U.S. Department of Education has certi­
fied that University J is eligible to participate in fed­
eral financial aid programs administered by that De­
partment, although University J chooses not to par­
ticipate. University J is an eligible educational insti­
tution. 

Example 2. Qualified higher education expenses. 
Student K receives a $3,000 qualified scholarship for 
the 1999 fall semester that is excludable from Student 
K’s gross income under section 117. Student K re­
ceives no other forms of financial assistance with re­
spect to the 1999 fall semester. Student K’s cost of at­
tendance for the 1999 fall semester, as determined by 
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Student K’s eligible educational institution for pur­
poses of calculating a student’s financial need in ac­
cordance with section 472 of the Higher Education 
Act, is $16,000. For the 1999 fall semester, Student 
K has qualified higher education expenses of $13,000 
(the cost of attendance as determined by the institu­
tion ($16,000) reduced by the qualified scholarship 
proceeds excludable from gross income ($3,000)). 

Example 3. Qualified education loan. Student L 
borrows money from a commercial bank to pay qual­
ified higher education expenses related to his enroll­
ment on a half-time basis in a graduate program at an 
eligible educational institution. Student L uses all the 
loan proceeds to pay qualified higher education ex­
penses incurred within a reasonable period of time af­
ter incurring the indebtedness. The loan is not feder­
ally guaranteed. The commercial bank is not related 
to Student L within the meaning of section 267(b) or 
707(b)(1). Student L’s loan is a qualified education 
loan within the meaning of section 221. 

Example 4. Qualified education loan. Student 
M signs a promissory note for a loan on August 15, 
1999, to pay for qualified higher education expenses 
for the 1999 fall and 2000 spring semesters. On Au­
gust 20, 1999, the lender disburses loan proceeds to 
Student M’s college. The college credits them to 
Student M’s account to pay qualified higher educa­
tion expenses for the 1999 fall semester, which be­
gins on August 23, 1999. On January 25, 2000, the 
lender disburses additional loan proceeds to Student 
M’s college. The college credits them to Student M’s 
account to pay qualified higher education expenses 
for the 2000 spring semester, which began on Jan­
uary 10, 2000. Student M’s qualified higher educa­
tion expenses for the two semesters are paid within a 
reasonable period of time, as the first loan disburse­
ment occurred within the 90 days prior to the start of 
the fall 1999 semester, and the second loan disburse­
ment occurred during the spring 2000 semester. 

Example 5. Qualified education loan. The facts 
are the same as in Example 4, except that in 2001 the 
college is not an eligible educational institution be­
cause it loses its eligibility to participate in certain 
federal financial aid programs administered by the 
U.S. Department of Education. The qualification of 
Student M’s loan, which was used to pay for quali­
fied higher education expenses for the 1999 fall and 
2000 spring semesters, as a qualified education loan 
is not affected by the college’s subsequent loss of el­
igibility. 

Example 6. Mixed-use loans. Student N signs a 
promissory note for a loan that is secured by Student 
N’s personal residence. Student N will use part of 
the loan proceeds to pay for certain improvements to 
Student N’s residence and part of the loan proceeds 
to pay qualified higher education expenses of Student 
N’s spouse. Because Student N obtains the loan not 
solely to pay qualified higher education expenses, the 
loan is not a qualified education loan. 

(g) Denial of double benefit. No deduc­
tion is allowed under this section for any 
amount for which a deduction is allowable 
under another provision of Chapter 1 of the 
Internal Revenue Code. No deduction is 
allowed under this section for any amount 
for which an exclusion is allowable under 
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section 108(f) (relating to cancellation of 
indebtedness). 

(h) Interest—(1) In general. Amounts  
paid on a qualified education loan are de­
ductible under section 221 if the amounts 
are interest for Federal income tax pur­
poses. For example, interest includes— 

(i) Qualified stated interest (as defined 
in §1.1273–1(c)); and 

(ii) Original issue discount, which gen­
erally includes capitalized interest. For 
purposes of section 221, capitalized inter­
est means any accrued and unpaid interest 
on a qualified education loan that, in accor­
dance with the terms of the loan, is added 
by the lender to the outstanding principal 
balance of the loan. 

(2) Operative rules for original issue 
discount—(i) In general. The  rules  to  de­
termine the amount of original issue dis­
count on a loan and the accruals of the dis­
count are in sections 163(e), 1271 through 
1275, and the regulations thereunder. In 
general, original issue discount is the ex­
cess of a loan’s stated redemption price at 
maturity (all payments due under the loan 
other than qualified stated interest pay­
ments) over its issue price (the amount 
loaned). Although original issue discount 
generally is deductible as it accrues under 
section 163(e) and §1.163–7, original is­
sue discount on a qualified education loan 
is not deductible until paid. See paragraph 
(h)(3) of this section to determine when 
original issue discount is paid. 

(ii) Treatment of loan origination fees 
by the borrower. If a loan origination fee 
is paid by the borrower other than for prop­
erty or services provided by the lender, 
the fee reduces the issue price of the loan, 
which creates original issue discount (or 
additional original issue discount) on the 
loan in an amount equal to the fee. See 
§1.1273–2(g). For an example of how a 
loan origination fee is taken into account, 
see Example 2 of paragraph (h)(4) of this 
section. 

(3) Allocation of payments.  See  
§§1.446–2(e) and 1.1275–2(a) for rules 
on allocating payments between interest 
and principal. In general, these rules treat 
a payment first as a payment of interest to 
the extent of the interest that has accrued 
and remains unpaid as of the date the pay­
ment is due, and second as a payment of 
principal. The characterization of a pay­
ment as either interest or principal under 
these rules applies regardless of how the 
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parties label the payment (either as interest 
or principal). Accordingly, the taxpayer 
may deduct the portion of a payment la­
beled as principal that these rules treat as 
a payment of interest on the loan, includ­
ing any portion attributable to capitalized 
interest or loan origination fees. 

(4) Examples. The following examples 
illustrate the rules of this paragraph (h). 
In the examples, assume that the institu­
tion the student attends is an eligible ed­
ucational institution, the loan is a qualified 
education loan, the student is legally obli­
gated to make interest payments under the 
terms of the loan, and any other applica­
ble requirements, if not otherwise speci­
fied, are fulfilled. The examples are as fol­
lows: 

Example 1. Capitalized interest. Interest on Stu­
dent O’s qualified education loan accrues while Stu­
dent O is in school, but Student O is not required 
to make any payments on the loan until six months 
after he graduates or otherwise leaves school. At 
that time, the lender capitalizes all accrued but un­
paid interest and adds it to the outstanding principal 
amount of the loan. Thereafter, Student O is required 
to make monthly payments of interest and principal 
on the loan. The interest payable on the loan, in­
cluding the capitalized interest, is original issue dis­
count. Therefore, in determining the total amount of 
interest paid on the qualified education loan during 
the 60-month period described in paragraph (e)(1) of 
this section, Student O may deduct any payments that 
§1.1275–2(a) treats as payments of interest, including 
any principal payments that are treated as payments 
of capitalized interest. See paragraph (h)(3) of this 
section. 

Example 2. Allocation of payments. The facts are 
the same as in Example 1 of this paragraph (h)(4), ex­
cept that, in addition, the lender charges Student O a 
loan origination fee, which is not for any property or 
services provided by the lender. Under §1.1273–2(g), 
the loan origination fee reduces the issue price of the 
loan, which reduction increases the amount of origi­
nal issue discount on the loan by the amount of the 
fee. The amount of original issue discount (which 
includes the capitalized interest and loan origination 
fee) that accrues each year is determined under sec­
tion 1272 and §1.1272–1. In effect, the loan origi­
nation fee accrues over the entire term of the loan. 
Because the loan has original issue discount, the pay­
ment ordering rules in §1.1275–2(a) must be used to 
determine how much of each payment is interest for 
federal tax purposes. See paragraph (h)(3) of this sec­
tion. Under §1.1275–2(a), each payment (regardless 
of its designation by the parties as either interest or 
principal) generally is treated first as a payment of 
original issue discount, to the extent of the original 
issue discount that has accrued as of the date the pay­
ment is due and has not been allocated to prior pay­
ments, and second as a payment of principal. There­
fore, in determining the total amount of interest paid 
on the qualified education loan during the 60-month 
period described in paragraph (e)(1) of this section, 
Student O may deduct any payments that the par­
ties label as principal but that are treated as payments 
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of original issue discount under §1.1275–2(a). The 
60-month period does not begin in the month in which 
the lender charges Student O the loan origination fee. 

(i) Special rules regarding 60-month 
limitation—(1) Refinancing. A quali­
fied education loan and all indebtedness 
incurred solely to refinance that loan 
constitute a single loan for purposes of 
calculating the 60-month period described 
in paragraph (e)(1) of this section. 

(2) Consolidated loans. A consoli­
dated loan is a single loan that refinances 
more than one qualified education loan of 
a borrower. For consolidated loans, the 
60-month period described in paragraph 
(e)(1) of this section begins on the latest 
date on which any of the underlying loans 
entered repayment status and includes any 
subsequent month in which the consoli­
dated loan is in repayment status.  

(3) Collapsed loans. A collapsed loan 
is two or more qualified education loans 
of a single taxpayer that constitute a sin­
gle qualified education loan for loan ser­
vicing purposes and for which the lender 
or servicer does not separately account. 
For a collapsed loan, the 60-month period 
described in paragraph (e)(1) of this sec­
tion begins on the latest date on which any 
of the underlying loans entered repayment 
status and includes any subsequent month 
in which any of the underlying loans is in 
repayment status. 

(4) Examples. The following examples 
illustrate the rules of this paragraph (i): 

Example 1. Refinancing. Student P obtains a 
qualified education loan to pay  for an undergradu­
ate degree at an eligible educational institution. Af­
ter graduation, Student P is required to make monthly 
interest payments on the loan beginning in January 
2000. Student P makes the required interest payments 
for 15 months. In April 2001, Student P borrows 
money from another lender exclusively to repay the 
first qualified education loan. The new loan requires 
interest payments to start immediately. At the time 
Student P must begin interest payments on the new 
loan, which is a qualified education loan, there are 45 
months remaining of the original 60-month period re-
ferred to in paragraph (e)(1) of this section. 

Example 2. Collapsed loans. To finance his edu­
cation, Student Q obtains four separate qualified ed­
ucation loans from Lender R. The loans enter repay­
ment status, and their respective 60-month periods 
described in paragraph (e)(1) of this section begin, in 
July, August, September, and December of 1999. Af­
ter all of Student Q’s loans have entered repayment 
status, Lender R informs Student Q that Lender R 
will transfer all four loans to Lender S. Following the 
transfer, Lender S treats the loans as a single  loan  for  
loan servicing purposes. Lender S sends Student Q 
a single statement that shows the total principal and 
interest, and does not keep separate records with re­
spect to each loan. With respect to the single col-
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lapsed loan, the 60-month period described in para­
graph (e)(1) of this section begins in December 1999. 

(j) Effective date.  This section is appli­
cable to interest due and paid on qualified 
education loans after January 21, 1999, if 
paid before January 1, 2002. Taxpayers 
also may apply this section to interest due 
and paid on qualified education loans af­
ter December 31, 1997, but before January 
21, 1999. This section also applies to in­
terest due and paid on qualified education 
loans in a taxable year beginning after De­
cember 31, 2010. 

Par. 3. Section 1.6050S–3 is amended 
by revising paragraphs (d)(1)(iii)(B) and 
(e)(1) to read as follows: 

§1.6050S–3 Information reporting 
for payments of interest on qualified 
education loans. 

*  * * * *  
(d)* * * (1)* * * 
(iii)* * * 
(B) In the case of qualified education 

loans made before September 1, 2004, for 
which the payee does not report payments 
of interest other than stated interest, state 
that the payor may be able to deduct addi­
tional amounts (such as certain loan origi­
nation fees and capitalized interest) not re­
ported on the statement; 

*  * * * *  
(e) Special rules—(1) Transitional rule 

for reporting of loan origination fees and 
capitalized interest — (i) Loans made be­
fore September 1, 2004. For qualified ed­
ucation loans made before September 1, 
2004, a payee is not required to report pay­
ments of loan origination fees or capital­
ized interest or to take such payments into 
account in determining the $600 amount 
for purposes of paragraph (a)(1) of this 
section. 

(ii) Loans made on or after September 
1, 2004. For qualified education loans 
made on or after September 1, 2004, a 
payee is required to report payments of in­
terest as described in §1.221–1(f). Under 
§1.221–1(f), interest includes loan origina­
tion fees that represent charges for the use 
or forbearance of money and capitalized 
interest. Under this paragraph (e)(1)(ii), a 
payee shall take such payments of inter­
est into account in determining the $600 
amount for purposes of paragraph (a)(1) of 
this section. For purposes of this section 
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and section 6050S, interest (including cap­
italized interest and loan origination fees) 
is treated as received, and is reportable, in 
the year the interest is treated as paid under 
the allocation rules in §1.221–1(f)(3). 

See §1.221–1(f) for rules relating to 
capitalized interest, and §1.221–1(f)(2)(ii) 
for rules relating to loan origination fees, 
on qualified education loans. 

* *  * * *  

Mark E. Matthews, 
Deputy Commissioner for 
Services and Enforcement. 

Approved April 27, 2004. 

Gregory F. Jenner, 
Acting Assistant Secretary of the Treasury. 

(Filed by the Office of the Federal Register on May 6, 2004, 
8:45 a.m., and published in the issue of the Federal Register 
for May 7, 2004, 69 F.R. 25489) 

Section 280G.—Golden 
Parachute Payments 

Federal short-term, mid-term, and long-term rates 
are set forth for the month of June 2004. See Rev. 
Rul. 2004-54, page 1024. 

Section 382.—Limitation 
on Net Operating Loss 
Carryforwards and Certain 
Built-In Losses Following 
Ownership Change 

The adjusted applicable federal long-term rate is 
set forth for the month of June 2004. See Rev. Rul. 
2004-54, page 1024. 

Section 412.—Minimum 
Funding Standards 

The adjusted applicable federal short-term, mid­
term, and long-term rates are set forth for the month 
of June 2004. See Rev. Rul. 2004-54, page 1024. 

Section 467.—Certain 
Payments for the Use of 
Property or Services 

The adjusted applicable federal short-term, mid­
term, and long-term rates are set forth for the month 
of June 2004. See Rev. Rul. 2004-54, page 1024. 
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Section 468.—Special 
Rules for Mining and Solid 
Waste Reclamation and 
Closing Costs 

The adjusted applicable federal short-term, mid­
term, and long-term rates are set forth for the month 
of June 2004. See Rev. Rul. 2004-54, page 1024. 

Section 482.—Allocation 
of Income and Deductions 
Among Taxpayers 

Federal short-term, mid-term, and long-term rates 
are set forth for the month of June 2004. See Rev. 
Rul. 2004-54, page 1024. 

Section 483.—Interest on 
Certain Deferred Payments 

The adjusted applicable federal short-term, mid­
term, and long-term rates are set forth for the month 
of June 2004. See Rev. Rul. 2004-54, page 1024. 

Section 642.—Special 
Rules for Credits and 
Deductions 

Federal short-term, mid-term, and long-term rates 
are set forth for the month of June 2004. See Rev. 
Rul. 2004-54, page 1024. 

Section 704.—Partner’s 
Distributive Share 
26 CFR 1.704–1: Partner’s distributive share. 

T.D. 9126 

DEPARTMENT OF 
THE TREASURY 
Internal Revenue Service 
26 CFR Part 1 

Section 704(b) and Capital 
Account Revaluations 

AGENCY: Internal Revenue Service 
(IRS), Treasury. 

ACTION: Final regulations. 

SUMMARY: This document contains fi­
nal regulations relating to the capital ac­
count maintenance rules under section 704 
of the Internal Revenue Code. These reg­
ulations expand the rules regarding a part-
nership’s right to adjust capital accounts to 
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